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Jackson County Municipal Vehicles & Equipment

Amendment 2 to Master Agreement 2023-JC-060-M

Amendment 02 to Master Agreement 2023-JC-060-M hereby executes the
following change effective June 1, 2025:

e Bucher: Pricing updates
e Cues: Pricing updates

All other terms and conditions remain unchanged.



NOTES TO POTENTIAL PROPOSERS: COMPLETE AND SUBMIT THIS FINAL PRICE SHEET

2. Prices are inclusive including delivery FOB Destination (unless EXCEPTIONS are stated in ATTACHMENT A).
3. Povide product brochures or catalogs, manufacturer specification sheets (electronic ) in PDF format.

5. Add Rows (not Columns) to list multiple product line items.
6. Leave blank or enter "No Bid" for any categories not being bid.

The Safety Company, LLC dba MTech Company

COPRO+ PRICING REV 2: EFFECTIVE 06/01/2025

4. Provide Manufacturer Warranty Information AND any Additional Vendor "Value-Added" Warranty for each item with your proposal.

ATTACHMENT A - PRICING

1. Enter Manufacturer Name and Model Number for each category being bid. Add rows under each category if needed. Complete specifications for each item being bid must be submitted with the bid response.

RFP JC-060-031023 - MUNICIPAL VEHICLES & EQUIPMENT

ORANGE CELLS = NEW PRODUCT ADDED TO CONTRACT

YELLOW CELLS = UPDATED PRICING FOR EXISTING CONTRACT PRODUCT
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A SEWER CLEANER/VACUUM TRUCKS
Dyna-Vac Dyna-Jet 8020 Enclosed Heated Jetter Truck Dyna-Vac DJ8020 Each NA Net price shown 324,900.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis included, 8 month lead time No
PipeHunter Trailer Mounted Sewer Jetter 35418 300 Gallon Tank, Single Axle Low HP PipeHunter 35418.00 Each NA Net price shown 80,000.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 90-120 day lead time No
PipeHunter Trailer Mounted Sewer Jetter 75418 700 Gallon Tank, Tandem Axle Axle Low HP PipeHunter 75418.00 Each NA Net price shown 82,500.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 90-120 day lead time No
PipeHunter Trailer Mounted Sewer Jetter 3744 300 Gallon Tank, Single Axle PipeHunter 3744.00 Each NA Net price shown 85,000.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 90-120 day lead time No
PipeHunter Trailer Mounted Sewer Jetter 4733 400 Gallon Tank, Single Axle PipeHunter 4733.00 Each NA Net price shown 87,500.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 90-120 day lead time No
PipeHunter Trailer Mounted Sewer Jetter 7744 700 Gallon Tank, Tandem Axle PipeHunter 7744.00 Each NA Net price shown 87,500.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 90-120 day lead time No
PipeHunter Trailer Mounted Sewer Jetter 7724-7733 700 Gallon Tank, Tandem Axle PipeHunter T724-71733 Each NA Net price shown 86,000.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 90-120 day lead time No
PipeHunter Trailer Mounted Sewer Jetter 71535-71526 700 Gallon Tank, Tandem Axle High HP PipeHunter 71535-71526 Each NA Net price shown 135,000.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 180 day lead time No
PipeHunter Truck Mounted Sewer Jetter 7744 Non-CDL, Twin Engine PipeHunter 7744TM Each NA Net price shown 100,000.00 Negotiated contract price Select chassis, 8 month lead time No
PipeHunter Truck Mounted Sewer Jetter 7724-7733 Non-CDL, Twin Engine PipeHunter 7724-7733TM Each NA Net price shown 100,000.00 Negotiated contract price Select chassis, 8 month lead time No
PipeHunter Truck Mounted Sewer Jetter 10D34, Single Engine PipeHunter 10D34T™M Each NA Net price shown 105,000.00 Negotiated contract price Select chassis, 8 month lead time No
PipeHunter Trailer Mounted VacHunter 4" 3235PH3HX 3Yd Debris Body PipeHunter 3235PH3HX Each NA Net price shown 115,000.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 120-150 day lead time No
PipeHunter Trailer Mounted VacHunter 6" 3235PH6HX 3Yd Debris Body PipeHunter 3235PHBHX Each NA Net price shown 260,000.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 180 day lead time No
PipeHunter Truck Mounted VacHunter 6" 4.5315PH6HX 4.5Yd Debris Body, Single Engine PipeHunter 4.5315PHBHXTM Each NA Net price shown 215,000.00 Negotiated contract price Select chassis, 8 month lead time No
PipeHunter Truck Mounted VacHunter 8" 86315PH8HX 8Yd Debris Body, Single Engine PipeHunter 86315PH8HXTM Each NA Net price shown 285,000.00 |  Negotiated contract price Select chassis, 8 month lead time No
PipeHunter Combination Sewer Cleaner Trailer 6" 3534PH6C 3Yd Debris Body PipeHunter 3534PH6C Each NA Net price shown 299,500.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 180 day lead time No
PipeHunter Combination Sewer Cleaner Truck 6" 3634PH6C 3Yd Debris Body, Single Engine PipeHunter 3634PHECTM Each NA Net price shown 235,000.00 Negotiated contract price Select chassis, 8 month lead time No
PipeHunter Combination Sewer Cleaner Truck 6" 71035PH6C 7Yd Debris Body, Single Engine PipeHunter 71035PHECTM Each NA Net price shown 275,000.00 Negotiated contract price Select chassis, 8 month lead time No
PipeHunter Combination Sewer Cleaner Truck 8" 121326PH8C 12Yd Debris Body, Single Engine PipeHunter 121326PH8CTM Each NA Net price shown 315,000.00 Negotiated contract price Select chassis, 8 month lead time No
PipeHunter Side-Trac Tracked Easement Machine PipeHunter Side-Trac Each NA Net price shown 47,500.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 90-120 day lead time No
PipeHunter Side-Kick Wheeled Easement Machine PipeHunter Side-Kick Each NA Net price shown 42,500.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 90-120 day lead time No
PipeHunter JetEye Sewer Jetter Televising System - Installed PipeHunter JetEye Each NA Net price shown 67,500.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 90-120 day lead time No
PipeHunter Jr. PipeHunter Skid Mounted Jetter PipeHunter Jr. PipeHunter Each NA Net price shown 25,000.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 90-120 day lead time No
Super Products SuperJet Truck Mounted Sewer Jetter Super Products SuperJet Each 224,419.98 5% 213,198.98 Negotiated contract price Select chassis, 6-8 month lead time No
Super Products Camel Max Combination Sewer Cleaning Truck Super Products Camel Max Each 398,546.72 5% 378,619.38 Negotiated contract price Select chassis, 6-8 month lead time No
Super Products Camel Max Catch Basin Cleaning Truck (no front hose reel) Super Products Camel Max CB Each 388,259.28 5% 368,846.32 Negotiated contract price Select chassis, 6-8 month lead time No
Super Products Mud Dog Hydro-Excavator Truck Super Products Mud Dog Each 477,634.00 5% 453,752.30 Negotiated contract price Select chassis, 6-8 month lead time No
Super Products Mud Dog 700 Compact Hydro-Excavator Truck Super Products Mud Dog 700 Each 368,641.00 5% 350,208.95 Negotiated contract price Select chassis, 6-8 month lead time No
B REFUSE TRUCKS

Fassi F165AZ Z Fold Waste Grapple/Crane Combination - Installed Marrel-Ampliroll F165AZ Each NA Net price shown 143,269.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 90 day lead time No

Each %

Each %

Each %
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ATTACHMENT A - PRICING

RFP JC-060-031023 - MUNICIPAL VEHICLES & EQUIPMENT

NOTES TO POTENTIAL PROPOSERS: COMPLETE AND SUBMIT THIS FINAL PRICE SHEET

1. Enter Manufacturer Name and Model Number for each category being bid. Add rows under each category if needed. Complete specifications for each item being bid must be submitted with the bid response.
2. Prices are inclusive including delivery FOB Destination (unless EXCEPTIONS are stated in ATTACHMENT A).

3. Povide product brochures or catalogs, manufacturer specification sheets (electronic ) in PDF format.

4. Provide Manufacturer Warranty Information AND any Additional Vendor "Value-Added" Warranty for each item with your proposal.

5. Add Rows (not Columns) to list multiple product line items.

6. Leave blank or enter "No Bid" for any categories not being bid.

The Safety Company, LLC dba MTech Company

COPRO+ PRICING REV 2: EFFECTIVE 06/01/2025
ORANGE CELLS = NEW PRODUCT ADDED TO CONTRACT
YELLOW CELLS = UPDATED PRICING FOR EXISTING CONTRACT PRODUCT

Percentage Off
List for Product | JCDOT/CoPro+

List Price options Price
(If a Percentage

High Volume Pricing Options /
Levels Offered
(Yes or No)

Manufacturer Model Unit of

Number {s) Measure Additional Information

Line ltem Line Item Description Discounts

Manufacturer Name (s)

Range; Describe.)

Each $ %

ROLL-OFF TRUCKS

Ampliroll AL-90L-14 - 13K Lb Hook Loader - Installed Marrel-Ampliroll AL-90L-14 Each NA Net price shown 66,943.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 90 day lead time No
Ampliroll AL-100L-16 - 20K Lb Hook Loader - Installed Marrel-Ampliroll AL-100L-16 Each NA Net price shown 75,500.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 90 day lead time No
Ampliroll AMP-140-220-20 - 35K Lb Hook Loader - Installed Marrel-Ampliroll AMP-140-220-20 Each NA Net price shown 84,208.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 90 day lead time No
Ampliroll AMP-150-220-20 - 40K Lb Hook Loader - Installed Marrel-Ampliroll AMP-150-220-20 Each NA Net price shown 89,195.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 90 day lead time No
Ampliroll AMP-160-212-20 - 50K Lb Hook Loader - Installed Marrel-Ampliroll AMP-160-212-20 Each NA Net price shown 91,505.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 90 day lead time No
Ampliroll ARB-60-22 - 60K Lb Cable Loader - Installed Marrel-Ampliroll ARB-60-22 Each NA Net price shown 86,692.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 90 day lead time No
Ampliroll ARB-75-22 - 75K Lb Cable Loader - Installed Marrel-Ampliroll ARB-75-22 Each NA Net price shown 95,615.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 90 day lead time No
STREET SWEEPERS

Bucher V65t Twin Engine Chassis Mounted Rear Dump 8.5 Yard Pure Vacuum Sweeper Dual GB Bucher V65t Dual GB Each NA Net price shown 197,348.00 Negotiated contract price Select chassis, 10 month lead time No
Bucher V65t Twin Engine Chassis Mounted Rear Dump 8.5 Yard Pure Vacuum Sweeper Single GB | Bucher V65t Single GB Each NA Net price shown 190,733.00 Negotiated contract price Select chassis, 10 month lead time No
Bucher V80t Twin Engine Chassis Mounted Rear Dump 10.5 Yard Pure Vacuum Sweeper Dual GB Bucher V80t Dual GB Each NA Net price shown 223,808.00 Negotiated contract price Select chassis, 10 month lead time No
Bucher V80t Twin Engine Chassis Mounted Rear Dump 10.5 Yard Pure Vacuum Sweeper Single GB | Bucher /80t Single GB Each NA Net price shown 217,193.00 Negotiated contract price Select chassis, 10 month lead time No
Bucher V65h Single Engine Chassis Mounted Rear Dump 8.5 Yard Pure VVacuum Sweeper Dual GB | Bucher V65h Dual GB Each NA Net price shown 198,450.00 Negotiated contract price Select chassis, 10 month lead time No
Bucher V65h Single Engine Chassis Mounted Rear Dump 8.5 Yard Pure Vacuum Sweeper Single GB | Bucher V/65h Single GB Each NA Net price shown 191,835.00 Negotiated contract price Select chassis, 10 month lead time No
Bucher R65m Single Engine Chassis Mounted Rear Dump 8.5 Yard Regenerative Air Sweeper Dual GB |Bucher R65m Each NA Net price shown 134,505.00 Negotiated contract price Select chassis, 10 month lead time No
Bucher E35m Single Engine Chassis Mounted High Side Dump 4.5 Yard Mechanical Sweeper Dual GB |Bucher E35m Each NA Net price shown 222,365.00 Negotiated contract price Select chassis, 10 month lead time No
Bucher CityCat 5006 Purpose Built Mid Rear Dump 7.3 Yard Compact Vacuum Sweeper Bucher CityCat 5006 Each NA Net price shown 226,458.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis included, 6 month lead time No
Bucher CityCat VR50e Electric Purpose Built Mid Rear Dump 7.3 Yard Compact Vacuum Sweeper Bucher CityCat VR50e Each NA Net price shown 570,544.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis included, 12 month lead time No
Bucher CityCat V20 Purpose Built Mid Rear Dump 2.6 Yard Compact Vacuum Sweeper Bucher CityCat V20 Each NA Net price shown 163,013.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis included, 6 month lead time No
Bucher CityCat VV20e Electric Purpose Built Mid Rear Dump 2.6 Yard Compact Vacuum Sweeper Bucher CityCat V20e Each NA Net price shown 377,402.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis included, 12 month lead time No
Global M3 Purpose Built High Rear Dump 5.6 Yard Three-Wheeled Mechanical Sweeper Global M3 Each NA Net price shown 259,647.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis included, 180 day lead time No
Global M4 Purpose Built High Rear Dump 5.6 Yard Four-Wheeled Mechanical Sweeper Global M4 Each NA Net price shown 326,470.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis included, 210 day lead time No
Global M4HSD Purpose Built High Side Dump 5.2 Yard Four-Wheeled Mechanical Sweeper Global M4HSD Each NA Net price shown 337,194.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis included, 210 day lead time No
Global R3Air Purpose Built High Rear Dump 5.8 Yard Three-Wheeled Regenerative Air Sweeper Global R3Air Each NA Net price shown 289,888.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis included, 180 day lead time No

- = - —— -
fi'fgi'vfezz'fv 100% Electric Purpose Built High Rear Dump 5.8 Yard Three-Whedled Regenerative |\ R3AIEV Each  |NA Net price shown 733,542.00 | Negotiated contract price | Chassis included, 12 month lead time No
Global R4Air Purpose Built High Rear Dump 5.8 Yard Four-Wheeled Regenerative Air Sweeper Global R4Air Each NA Net price shown 357,183.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis included, 210 day lead time No
- = - — —

S‘II;)::‘IJ?AWEV 100% Electric Purpose Built High Rear Dump 5.8 Yard Four-Wheeled Regenerative Air Global R4AIrEV Each NA Net price shown 779,009.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis included, 12 month lead time No
Global V6Air Chassis Mounted Rear Dump 8.0 Yard Vacuum/Regenerative Air Sweeper Global V6AIr Each NA Net price shown 390,171.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis included, 12 month lead time No
Global M3 Electric Hybrid Purpose Built High Rear Dump 5.6 Yard Three-Wheeled Mechanical Sweeper | Global M3EH Each NA Net price shown 525,081.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis included, 8 month lead time No
Global M4 Electric Hybrid Purpose Built High Rear Dump 5.6 Yard Four-Wheeled Mechanical Sweeper |Global M4EH Each NA Net price shown 565,947.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis included, 8 month lead time No
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NOTES TO POTENTIAL PROPOSERS: COMPLETE AND SUBMIT THIS FINAL PRICE SHEET

2. Prices are inclusive including delivery FOB Destination (unless EXCEPTIONS are stated in ATTACHMENT A).
3. Povide product brochures or catalogs, manufacturer specification sheets (electronic ) in PDF format.

5. Add Rows (not Columns) to list multiple product line items.
6. Leave blank or enter "No Bid" for any categories not being bid.

The Safety Company, LLC dba MTech Company

COPRO+ PRICING REV 2: EFFECTIVE 06/01/2025

ATTACHMENT A - PRICING

RFP JC-060-031023 - MUNICIPAL VEHICLES & EQUIPMENT

4. Provide Manufacturer Warranty Information AND any Additional Vendor "Value-Added" Warranty for each item with your proposal.

1. Enter Manufacturer Name and Model Number for each category being bid. Add rows under each category if needed. Complete specifications for each item being bid must be submitted with the bid response.

ORANGE CELLS = NEW PRODUCT ADDED TO CONTRACT

YELLOW CELLS = UPDATED PRICING FOR EXISTING CONTRACT PRODUCT

Line ltem Line Item Description

Manufacturer Name (s)

Manufacturer Model
Number (s)

Unit of
Measure

List Price

Percentage Off
List for Product
options
(If a Percentage
Range; Describe.)

JCDOT / CoPro+

Price

Discounts

Additional Information

High Volume Pricing Options /
Levels Offered
(Yes or No)

Global M4 ZE Fuel Cell Purpose Built High Rear Dump 5.6 Yard Four-Wheeled Mechanical Sweeper | Global Net price shown | § 840,962.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis included, 12 month lead time
= - S -
(SB‘I:V)::‘IXEV 100% Electric Purpose Built High Rear Dump 5.6 Yard For-WWheeled Mechanical Global M4EV Each NA Net price shown | § 751,752.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis included, 12 month lead time No
s - —— -
gw:::)gsEv 100% Electric Purpose Built High Rear Dump 5.6 Yard Three-Wheeled Mechanical Global M3EV Each NA Net price shown | $ 695,647.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis included, 12 month lead time No
E DUMP TRUCKS
* See Dump Body Attachment Options for Ampliroll Systems Each %
Each %
Each %
Each %
Each %
F RIDE ON ROLLERS/TANDEM ROLLERS
Each %
Each %
Each %
Each %
Each %
G BOX TRUCKS
Each %
Each %
Each %
Each %
Each %
H OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS AND ACCESSORIES
AxionLift AT40 Aluminum Body Truck Package AxionLift AT40 Aluminum Pkg Each NA Net price shown 239,900.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis included, 6 month lead time No
AxionLift AT40 Steel Body Truck Package AxionLift AT40 Steel Pkg Each NA Net price shown 224,900.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis included, 6 month lead time No
AxionLift AT37 Aluminum Body Truck Package AxionLift AT37 Aluminum Pkg Each NA Net price shown 239,900.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis included, 6 month lead time No
AxionLift AT37 Steel Body Truck Package AxionLift AT37 Steel Pkg Each NA Net price shown 224,900.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis included, 6 month lead time No
AxionLift UR29 Pickup Truck Package AxionLift UR?29 Pickup Pkg Each NA Net price shown 149,900.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis included, 6 month lead time No
Cues MPlus+ Portable Lateral & Mini-Mainline Push System Cues MPlus+ Each NA Net price shown 21,277.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 8 week lead time No
Cues QZ3 Quick Zoom Pole Camera Cues QT314 Each NA Net price shown 24,503.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 8 week lead time No
Cues 541 Flexiprobe 100' Plumbers Reel w/1" Camera Cues PLU Each NA Net price shown 8,947.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 3-4 week lead time No
Cues 541 Flexiprobe 200' Plumbers Reel w/1" Camera Cues PLUSL2 Each NA Net price shown 10,449.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 3-4 week lead time No
Cues 541 Flexiprobe 115' Mini Reel w/1" Camera Cues FLEX-1 Each NA Net price shown 10,320.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 3-4 week lead time No
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ATTACHMENT A - PRICING

RFP JC-060-031023 - MUNICIPAL VEHICLES & EQUIPMENT

NOTES TO POTENTIAL PROPOSERS: COMPLETE AND SUBMIT THIS FINAL PRICE SHEET

1. Enter Manufacturer Name and Model Number for each category being bid. Add rows under each category if needed. Complete specifications for each item being bid must be submitted with the bid response.
2. Prices are inclusive including delivery FOB Destination (unless EXCEPTIONS are stated in ATTACHMENT A).

3. Povide product brochures or catalogs, manufacturer specification sheets (electronic ) in PDF format.

4. Provide Manufacturer Warranty Information AND any Additional Vendor "Value-Added" Warranty for each item with your proposal.

5. Add Rows (not Columns) to list multiple product line items.

6. Leave blank or enter "No Bid" for any categories not being bid.

The Safety Company, LLC dba MTech Company

COPRO+ PRICING REV 2: EFFECTIVE 06/01/2025
ORANGE CELLS = NEW PRODUCT ADDED TO CONTRACT
YELLOW CELLS = UPDATED PRICING FOR EXISTING CONTRACT PRODUCT

Percentage Off JCDOT | CoPro+
. List for Product (A High Volume Pricing Options /
Manufacturer Name (s) EMEEITELRe) | - ilitws List Price options Price Discounts Additional Information Levels Offered
Number (s) Measure (If a Percentage (Yes or No)
Range; Describe.)

Line ltem Line Item Description

Cues 541 Flexiprobe 115" Mini Reel w/2" Self Leveling Camera FLEX-2 Net price shown 11,794.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 3-4 week lead time

Cues 542 Flexiprobe 200' Standard Reel w/1" Camera Cues FLEX Each NA Net price shown 11,216.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 3-4 week lead time No
Cues 542 Flexiprobe 200' Standard Reel w/2" Self Leveling Camera Cues FLEX-3 Each NA Net price shown 12,661.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 3-4 week lead time No
Cues 542 Flexiprobe 400' Standard Reel w/1" Camera Cues FLEX-4 Each NA Net price shown 12,829.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 3-4 week lead time No
Cues 542 Flexiprobe 400' Standard Reel w/2" Self Leveling Camera Cues FLEX-6 Each NA Net price shown 13,461.00 [  Negotiated contract price No chassis, 3-4 week lead time No
Cues 543 Flexiprobe 500' Large Reel w/1" Camera Cues FLEX-501 Each NA Net price shown 19,980.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 3-4 week lead time No
Cues 543 Flexiprobe 500' Large Reel w/2" Self Leveling Camera Cues FLEX-502 Each NA Net price shown 20,779.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 3-4 week lead time No
Cues 540 Flexiprobe Dual 542 200' Standard & 541 100' Plumbers Reels w/1" & 2" Cameras Cues DUAL-100 Each NA Net price shown 17,500.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 3-4 week lead time No
Cues 540 Flexiprobe Dual 542 200' Standard & 541 200' Plumbers Reels w/1" & 2" Cameras Cues DUAL-200 Each NA Net price shown 17,889.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 3-4 week lead time No
Cues 550 Flexitrax Small Basic Crawler Inspection Package Cues Basic Each NA Net price shown 58,924.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 8 week lead time No
Cues 550 Flexitrax Small Standard Crawler Inspection Package Cues Stand Each NA Net price shown 65,668.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 8 week lead time No
Cues 550 Flexitrax Large Basic Crawler Inspection Package Cues LG Econ Each NA Net price shown 66,726.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 8 week lead time No
Cues 550 Flexitrax Large Standard Crawler Inspection Package Cues LG Stand Each NA Net price shown 83,258.00 |  Negotiated contract price No chassis, 8 week lead time No
Cues 550 Flexitrax Large Deluxe Crawler Inspection Package Cues LG Del Each NA Net price shown 106,008.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 8 week lead time No
Cues 550 Flexitrax Platinum Inspection Package Cues Platinum Each NA Net price shown 126,590.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 8 week lead time No
Cues 550 Ford Transit Inspection VVan/Upfit (Must Also Select 550 Package - NOT INCLUDED) Cues PP Transit Each NA Net price shown 169,900.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis included, 120 day lead time No
Cues K2 Portable Mainline and Small Diameter Pipe TV Inspection System Cues K2 Each NA Net price shown 101,960.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 90-120 day lead time No
Cues MarK3 Portable Mainline and Small Diameter Pipe TV Inspection System Cues MarK3 Each NA Net price shown 134,791.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 90-120 day lead time No
Cues Cube Base Station Portable Mainline TV Inspection System Cues CUBE Each NA Net price shown 140,179.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 90-120 day lead time No
Cues Trailer Mounted Mainline TV Inspection System Cues TRL Each NA Net price shown 225,458.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 90-120 day lead time No
Cues Ford Cargo Van Mounted Mainline TV Inspection Summit System Cues Ford Each NA Net price shown 293,256.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis included, 120 day lead time No
Cues Sprinter Cargo Van Mounted Mainline System Cues SP3500 Each NA Net price shown 287,961.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis included, 120 day lead time No
Cues Ford E-450 DRW Cutaway Mounted Mainline TV Inspection Summit System Cues E-450-DRW Each NA Net price shown 307,844.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis included, 120 day lead time No
Cues Ford F-550 Diesel Mounted Mainline TV Inspection Summit System Cues F-550-Diesel Each NA Net price shown 358,367.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis included, 120 day lead time No
Hurco Spin Doctor Valve Exerciser SD400 Boom (Vertically aligned, 400 ft Ibs of torque) Hurco SD400 Each NA Net price shown 10,900.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 180 day lead time No
Hurco Spin Doctor Valve Exerciser SD800 Boom (Vertically aligned, 800 ft Ibs of torque) Hurco SD800 Each NA Net price shown 14,050.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 180 day lead time No
Hurco Spin Doctor Valve Exerciser ERB800 Boom (Horizontally aligned, 800 ft Ibs of torque) Hurco ERB800 Each NA Net price shown 19,930.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 180 day lead time No
Hurco Spin Doctor Valve Exerciser Handheld Hurco HH500 Each NA Net price shown 6,717.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 180 day lead time No
Hurco VAC300G Vac Trailer, 300 Gallon 37HP Gas (VAC300G-SK for Skid Mount) Hurco VAC300G Each NA Net price shown 48,785.00 |  Negotiated contract price No chassis, 180 day lead time No
Hurco VAC300D Vac Trailer, 300 Gallon 49.6 bhp Diesel (VAC300D-SK for Skid Mount) Hurco VAC300D Each NA Net price shown 63,569.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 180 day lead time No
Hurco VAC600G Vac Trailer, 630 Gallon 37HP Gas (VACB00G-SK for Skid Mount) Hurco VAC600G Each NA Net price shown 60,335.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 180 day lead time No
Hurco VAC600D Vac Trailer, 630 Gallon 49.6 bhp Diesel (VAC600D-SK for Skid Mount) Hurco VVAC600D Each NA Net price shown 76,306.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 180 day lead time No
Hurco VAC300D-HCFM Vac Trailer, 300 Gallon 49.6 bhp Diesel 4" High CFM Hurco VVAC300D-HCFM Each NA Net price shown 65,627.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 180 day lead time No
Hurco VAC600D-HCFM Vac Trailer, 630 Gallon 49.6 bhp Diesel 4" High CFM Hurco VVAC600D-HCFM Each NA Net price shown 78,857.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 180 day lead time No
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ATTACHMENT A - PRICING

RFP JC-060-031023 - MUNICIPAL VEHICLES & EQUIPMENT

NOTES TO POTENTIAL PROPOSERS: COMPLETE AND SUBMIT THIS FINAL PRICE SHEET
1. Enter Manufacturer Name and Model Number for each category being bid. Add rows under each category if needed. Complete specifications for each item being bid must be submitted with the bid response.
2. Prices are inclusive including delivery FOB Destination (unless EXCEPTIONS are stated in ATTACHMENT A).

3. Povide product brochures or catalogs, manufacturer specification sheets (electronic ) in PDF format.

4. Provide Manufacturer Warranty Information AND any Additional Vendor "Value-Added" Warranty for each item with your proposal.

5. Add Rows (not Columns) to list multiple product line items.

6. Leave blank or enter "No Bid" for any categories not being bid.

The Safety Company, LLC dba MTech Company

COPRO+ PRICING REV 2: EFFECTIVE 06/01/2025
ORANGE CELLS = NEW PRODUCT ADDED TO CONTRACT
YELLOW CELLS = UPDATED PRICING FOR EXISTING CONTRACT PRODUCT

Percentage Off
List for Product | JCDOT/CoPro+
List Price options Price
(If a Percentage
Range; Describe.)

High Volume Pricing Options /
Levels Offered
(Yes or No)

Manufacturer Model Unit of

Number {s) Measure Additional Information

Line ltem Line Item Description Manufacturer Name (s) Discounts

Hurco VAC600G-DT Vac Trailer, 630 Gallon 37HP Gas w/Hydraulic Dump Hurco VAC600G-DT Net price shown 70,835.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 180 day lead time

Hurco VAC600D-DT Vac Trailer, 630 Gallon 49.6 bhp Diesel w/Hydraulic Dump Hurco VVAC600D-DT Each NA Net price shown 86,806.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 180 day lead time No
Hurco VAC600D-HCFM-DT Vac Trailer, 630 Gallon 49.6 bhp Diesel 4" High CFM w/Hydraulic Dump  [Hurco VVAC600D-HCFM-DT Each NA Net price shown 89,357.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 180 day lead time No
Karcher MIC42 Multi-Functional Articulating Municipal Sidewalk Tractor 42 HP Karcher-Holder MIC42 Each NA Net price shown 106,487.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 120-150 day lead time No
Karcher Holder X45i Multi-Functional Articulating Municipal Sidewalk Tractor 44 HP Karcher-Holder X451 Each NA Net price shown 72,251.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 120-150 day lead time No
Karcher Holder C70 SC Multi-Functional Articulating Municipal Sidewalk Tractor 74 HP Karcher-Holder C70 Each NA Net price shown 165,604.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 120-150 day lead time No
Karcher Holder S75 Multi-Functional Articulating Municipal Sidewalk Tractor 75 HP Karcher-Holder S75 Each NA Net price shown 188,004.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 120-150 day lead time No
Karcher Holder S100 Multi-Functional Articulating Municipal Sidewalk Tractor 101 HP Karcher-Holder S100 Each NA Net price shown 195,927.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 120-150 day lead time No
Karcher Holder S130 Multi-Functional Articulating Municipal Sidewalk Tractor 129 HP Karcher-Holder S130 Each NA Net price shown 208,620.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 120-150 day lead time No
Karcher MC130 Compact Vacuum Sweeper 66 HP Karcher-Holder MC130 Each NA Net price shown 179,437.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 120-150 day lead time No
Karcher MC230 Compact Vacuum Sweeper 100 HP Karcher-Holder MC230 Each NA Net price shown 261,228.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 120-150 day lead time No
Karcher MCMG00 Mechanical Sweeper 154 HP Karcher-Holder MCM&600 Each NA Net price shown 346,645.00 |  Negotiated contract price No chassis, 180 day lead time No
Maintainer Crane Service Body - H7024ST Crane (Price for Crane Only - Must Build Out Package) Maintainer H7024ST Each NA Net price shown 34,849.23 Negotiated contract price Select chassis, 12 month lead time No
Maintainer Crane Service Body - H10025ST Crane (Price for Crane Only - Must Build Out Package)  |Maintainer H10025ST Each NA Net price shown 46,107.85 Negotiated contract price Select chassis, 12 month lead time No
ODB Xtreme Vac LCT600 Tow Behind Trailer Debris Collector (Curb Side Pickup) ODB-Xtreme Vac LCT60019 Each NA Net price shown 71,412.08 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 90-120 day lead time No
ODB Xtreme Vac LCT650 Tow Behind Trailer Debris Collector ODB-Xtreme Vac LCT65019 Each NA Net price shown 82,598.33 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 90-120 day lead time No
ODB Xtreme Vac LCT450 Tow Behind Trailer Debris Collector ODB-Xtreme Vac LCT45019 Each NA Net price shown 75,3%4.26 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 90-120 day lead time No
ODB Xtreme Vac DCL500SM16 Chassis Mounted Debris Collector 16 Yard (Non-CDL) ODB-Xtreme Vac DCL500SM16 Each NA Net price shown 86,065.60 Negotiated contract price Select chassis, 6-8 month lead time No
ODB Xtreme Vac DCL8031 Self-Contained Trailer Debris Collector 10 Yard 24 HP Diesel Engine ODB-Xtreme Vac DCL8031 Each NA Net price shown 77,071.36 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 90-120 day lead time No
ODB Xtreme Vac DCL8031 Hooklift Body Debris Collector 10 Yard 24 HP Diesel Engine ODB-Xtreme Vac DCL8031HL Each NA Net price shown 76,997.11 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 90-120 day lead time No
ODB Xtreme Vac DCL8031 Switch and Go Debris Collector 10 Yard 24 HP Diesel Engine ODB-Xtreme Vac DCL8031SNG Each NA Net price shown 73,853.01 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 90-120 day lead time No
ODB Xtreme Vac DCL800TM14 Self-Contained Trailer Debris Collector 14 Yard ODB-Xtreme Vac DCL800TM14 Each NA Net price shown 112,939.60 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 120-150 day lead time No
ODB Xtreme Vac DCL800TMZ20 Self-Contained Trailer Debris Collector 20 Yard ODB-Xtreme Vac DCL800TM20 Each NA Net price shown 122,468.54 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 120-150 day lead time No
ODB Xtreme Vac DCL800TM25 Self-Contained Trailer Debris Collector 25 Yard ODB-Xtreme Vac DCL800TM25 Each NA Net price shown 124,678.42 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 120-150 day lead time No
ODB Xtreme Vac DCL800TM30 Self-Contained Trailer Debris Collector 30 Yard ODB-Xtreme Vac DCL800TM30 Each NA Net price shown 130,184.49 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 120-150 day lead time No
ODB Xtreme Vac DCL750TM25 Self-Contained Trailer Debris Collector 25 Yard (VE-Diesel Engine) ~ |ODB-Xtreme Vac DCL750TM25 Each NA Net price shown 121,487.19 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 90-120 day lead time No
ODB Xtreme Vac DCL800SM25 Chassis Mounted Debris Collector 25 Yard (Three Axis Boom) ODB-Xtreme Vac DCL800SM25 Each NA Net price shown 146,809.31 Negotiated contract price | Select chassis, 120-150 day lead time No
ODB Xtreme Vac DCL1000SE25 Chassis Mounted Debris Collector 25 Yard (Single Engine) ODB-Xtreme Vac DCL1000SE25 Each NA Net price shown 179,251.26 | Negotiated contract price Select chassis, 6-8 month lead time No
ODB Xtreme Vac DCL800SM14HL Hook Lift Debris Collector 14 Yard (Three Axis Boom) ODB-Xtreme Vac DCL800SM14HL Each NA Net price shown 157,055.12 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 6-8 mo lead time No
ODB Xtreme Vac DCL800SM20HL Hook Lift Debris Collector 20 Yard (Three Axis Boom) ODB-Xtreme Vac DCL800SM20HL Each NA Net price shown 160,385.83 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 6-8 mo lead time No
ODB Xtreme Vac DCL800SM25HL Hook Lift Debris Collector 25 Yard (Three Axis Boom) ODB-Xtreme Vac DCL800SM25HL Each NA Net price shown 162,883.87 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 6-8 mo lead time No
ODB Xtreme Vac DCL800SM30HL Hook Lift Debris Collector 30 Yard (Three Axis Boom) ODB-Xtreme Vac DCL800SM30HL Each NA Net price shown 170,990.24 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 6-8 mo lead time No
ODB Xtreme Vac DCL700 Skid Mount Debris Collector ODB-Xtreme Vac DCLSKID Each NA Net price shown 69,503.87 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 90-120 day lead time No
ODB Xtreme Vac DCL7003X 3 Axis Skid Mount Debris Collector ODB-Xtreme Vac DCLSKID3X Each NA Net price shown 105,715.74 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 90-120 day lead time No
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ATTACHMENT A - PRICING

RFP JC-060-031023 - MUNICIPAL VEHICLES & EQUIPMENT

NOTES TO POTENTIAL PROPOSERS: COMPLETE AND SUBMIT THIS FINAL PRICE SHEET

1. Enter Manufacturer Name and Model Number for each category being bid. Add rows under each category if needed. Complete specifications for each item being bid must be submitted with the bid response.
2. Prices are inclusive including delivery FOB Destination (unless EXCEPTIONS are stated in ATTACHMENT A).

3. Povide product brochures or catalogs, manufacturer specification sheets (electronic ) in PDF format.

5. Add Rows (not Columns) to list multiple product line items.
6. Leave blank or enter "No Bid" for any categories not being bid.

The Safety Company, LLC dba MTech Company

COPRO+ PRICING REV 2: EFFECTIVE 06/01/2025

4. Provide Manufacturer Warranty Information AND any Additional Vendor "Value-Added" Warranty for each item with your proposal.

ORANGE CELLS = NEW PRODUCT ADDED TO CONTRACT

YELLOW CELLS = UPDATED PRICING FOR EXISTING CONTRACT PRODUCT

Line ltem Line Item Description

Manufacturer Name (s)

Manufacturer Model
Number (s)

Unit of

Measure

Percentage Off
List for Product

options

(If a Percentage
Range; Describe.)

JCDOT / CoPro+
Price

Discounts

Additional Information

High Volume Pricing Options /
Levels Offered
(Yes or No)

RC Mowers R-44 Tracked 44" Rotary Mower, 45 Degrees Max Slope RC Mowers Net price shown 40,950.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 30-60 day lead time

RC Mowers R-52 Tracked 52" Rotary Mower, 50 Degrees Max Slope RC Mowers R-52 Each NA Net price shown 65,950.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 30-60 day lead time No
RC Mowers R-60 Tracked 60" Rotary Mower, 50 Degrees Max Slope RC Mowers R-60 Each NA Net price shown 69,950.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 30-60 day lead time No
RC Mowers A-60 AMR Autonomous 60" Rotary Mower, 23.5hp Kawasaki Engine RC Mowers A-60 Each NA Net price shown 65,950.00 Negotiated contract price No chassis, 90-120 day lead time No
Stahl Challenger ST Il CST82VVS 82" Steel Service Body Stahl CST82VVS Each NA Net price shown 12,157.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Challenger ST Il CST82VVST 82" Steel Service Body Stahl CST82VVST Each NA Net price shown 14,143.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Challenger ST Il CST82VVSLT 82" Steel Service Body Stahl CST82VVSLT Each NA Net price shown 14,143.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Challenger ST Il CST98VVS 98" Steel Service Body Stahl CSTRBVVS Each NA Net price shown 12,000.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Challenger ST Il CST98VVSL 98" Steel Service Body Stahl CST98VVSL Each NA Net price shown 12,464.29 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Challenger ST Il CST98VVST 98" Steel Service Body Stahl CST9VVST Each NA Net price shown 14,814.29 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Challenger ST Il CST98VVSLT 98" Steel Service Body Stahl CST9VVSLT Each NA Net price shown 14,814.29 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Challenger ST Il CST98CCS 98" Steel Service Body Stahl CST98CCS Each NA Net price shown 12,464.29 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Challenger ST Il CST98CVS 98" Steel Service Body Stahl CST98CVS Each NA Net price shown 12,464.29 [  Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Challenger ST Il CST98VCS 98" Steel Service Body Stahl CSTRVCS Each NA Net price shown 12,464.29 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Challenger ST Il CST98VVD 98" Steel Service Body Stahl CSTVVD Each NA Net price shown 12,514.29 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Challenger ST Il CST98VVD-NWB 98" Steel Service Body Stahl CST98VVD-NWB Each NA Net price shown 12,514.29 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Challenger ST Il CST98VVDT 98" Steel Service Body Stahl CST9VVDT Each NA Net price shown 17,457.14 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Challenger ST Il CST98VVDT-NWB 98" Steel Service Body Stahl CST98VVDT-NWB Each NA Net price shown 17,457.14 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Challenger ST Il CST110VVS 110" Steel Service Body Stahl CST1MOVVS Each NA Net price shown 12,942.86 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Challenger ST Il CST110VVST 110" Steel Service Body Stahl CST1MOVVST Each NA Net price shown 16,607.14 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Challenger ST 11 CST110VVD 110" Steel Service Body (PN 205908) Stahl CST110VVD (PN 205908) Each NA Net price shown 13,414.29 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Challenger ST Il CST110VVD 110" Steel Service Body (PN 205916) Stahl CST110VVD (PN 205916) Each NA Net price shown 13,521.43 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Challenger ST Il CST110VVDT 110" Steel Service Body Stahl CST110VVDT Each NA Net price shown 17,314.29 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Challenger ST Il CST110VVDT-NWB 110" Steel Service Body Stahl CST110VVDT-NWB Each NA Net price shown 17,314.29 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Challenger ST Il CST134VVD 134" Steel Service Body (PN 205925) Stahl CST134VVD (PN 205925) Each NA Net price shown 15,921.43 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Challenger ST Il CST134VVD 134" Steel Service Body (PN 206161) Stahl CST134VVD (PN 206161) Each NA Net price shown 16,207.14 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Challenger ST Il CST134VVD-NWB 134" Steel Service Body Stahl CST134VVD-NWB Each NA Net price shown 16,207.14 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Challenger ST Il CST134VVDT 134" Steel Service Body Stahl CST134VVDT Each NA Net price shown 19,535.71 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Challenger SQ102S Gooseneck Flatbed Body - 8 ft SRW Stahl SQ102S Each NA Net price shown 7,664.00 |  Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Challenger SQ102D Gooseneck Flatbed Body - 8 ft DRW Stahl SQ102D Each NA Net price shown 7,814.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Challenger SQ114D Gooseneck Flatbed Body - 9 ft DRW Stahl SQ114D Each NA Net price shown 8,286.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Challenger SQ138D Gooseneck Flatbed Body - 11 ft DRW Stahl SQ138D Each NA Net price shown 8,629.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Challenger Elite 98VVST-48.5 Gooseneck Hauler Body - 8 ft SRW Stahl 98VVST-48.5 Each NA Net price shown 16,400.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Challenger Elite 98VVDT-52.5 Gooseneck Hauler Body - 8 ft DRW Stahl 98VVDT-52.5 Each NA Net price shown 17,750.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
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Stahl Challenger Elite 110VVDT-52.5 Gooseneck Hauler Body - 9 ft DRW 110VVDT-52.5 Net price shown 18,871.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time

Stahl Challenger Elite 134VVDT-52.5 Gooseneck Hauler Body - 11 ft DRW Stahl 134VVDT-52.5 Each NA Net price shown 20,121.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Arbortech Chip Body 11 ft No L-Box Stahl Chip 11 ft No L-Box Each NA Net price shown 37,457.14 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Arbortech Chip Body 11 ft With L-Box Stahl Chip 11 ft With L-Box Each NA Net price shown 38,271.43 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Arbortech Chip Body 14 ft No L-Box Stahl Chip 14 ft No L-Box Each NA Net price shown 44,671.43 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Arbortech Chip Body 14 ft With L-Box Stahl Chip 14 ft With L-Box Each NA Net price shown 46,171.43 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Arbortech Chip Body 16 ft No L-Box Stahl Chip 16 ft No L-Box Each NA Net price shown 50,471.43 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
Stahl Arbortech Chip Body 16 ft With L-Box Stahl Chip 16 ft With L-Box Each NA Net price shown 51,200.00 Negotiated contract price Chassis NOT incl., 56 mo lead time No
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